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paiher
Sticky Note
Purpose: To show support and ensure that the claimed amount matches up to the supporting documents (invoices and gl) provided by the Zoo.
Source: Cathy Crosby, Board Coordinator.
Procedures: Scan through gl and invoices to ensure that each subtotal and totals tie to one another and is equal to the requested reimbursement amounts.
Conclusion: Invoices and gl ties to each other and is equal to the amount requested in this 2018-01C Capital Claim. Reimbursement is okay to be processed.
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                                    373.75    +
                               78,613.82    +
                                 2,121.55    +
                               21,812.65    +
                               21,422.75    +
                                           10    =
Total [6 items]    124,354.52    T
                                                   
                             124,354.52     -
                                           10    =
Total [2 items]    124,344.52    T
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paiher
Sticky Note
Reduced by $7,300 per Cathy Crosby's email.
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Ties to attached disbursement 
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                             85,913.82     -
                                    7,300    =
Total [2 items]    78,613.82    T


paiher
Sticky Note
Reduced by $7,300 per Cathy Crosby's email.
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Ties to attached general ledger
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paiher
Text Box
                                     651    +
                                  55.44    +
                                  1,767    +
                                  55.44    +
                                     120    +
                                  232.5    +
                                177.66    =
Total [7 items]    3,059.04    T
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                                                                  1,302    +
                                    92.4    +
                                     360    +
                                  232.5    +
                                116.34    =
Total [5 items]    2,103.24    T
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paiher
Text Box
                                     651    +
                                  55.44    +
                                  3,255    +
                                221.76    +
                                  1,300    +
                                426.25    +
                                364.42    =
Total [7 items]    6,273.87    T
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Per Mayra Boganwright this 
invoice is not included in claim 
2018-01c and should be 
ignored. 
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From: Crosby, Catherine
To: Her, Pai
Cc: Marks, Megan; Reyes, Becky; Reynoso, Jose; "Rick Treatch"; "Mayra Boganwright"
Subject: FW: 2018-01C Capital Claim
Date: Thursday, February 8, 2018 9:58:50 AM
Attachments: Outback Concrete WPA Proposal, signed.pdf

RE 2018-01C Capital Claim.msg
BSK inv # 0082352 page 2.pdf
Cap Proj 2018-01c 1.31.18.pdf
Mark Rossi sculpture price list 12.15.17.pdf

Good morning Pai,
I have completed my review of this claim.  Since we cannot reimburse for a deposit for Mark Rossi's
sculptures without the Authority's approval, Rick says that they will submit the invoice for the $7,300
deposit after they receive the sculptures.  So please deduct that amount from the Children's' Water Play
Area (Wilderness Falls).

Please see the original message explaining the delay in receipt of some of the invoices.  Their age did
not quite require an explanation, but was included (and appreciated) anyway.  (FYI, see the Procedures
Paragraph C.1 on page 15). 
http://www.zooauthority.org/docs/ContractsProcedures/2016.06.29ApprovedRevisedZAProcedures.pdf

Zoo staff has provided the additional documents attached.  (Take a look at message with photos of the
clay prototypes of the sculptures.  They are charming!)

Please contact me if you have questions.
Thank you,
Cathy
600-4305

mailto:/O=COUNTY OF FRESNO/OU=SERVICES/CN=RECIPIENTS/CN=CAC0510
mailto:paiher@co.fresno.ca.us
mailto:mmarks@co.fresno.ca.us
mailto:BReyes@co.fresno.ca.us
mailto:jreynoso@co.fresno.ca.us
mailto:RTreatch@fresnochaffeezoo.org
mailto:mboganwright@fresnochaffeezoo.org
http://www.zooauthority.org/docs/ContractsProcedures/2016.06.29ApprovedRevisedZAProcedures.pdf
mailto:RTreatch@fresnochaffeezoo.org
mailto:CCrosby@co.fresno.ca.us






RE: 2018-01C Capital Claim

		From

		Mayra Boganwright

		To

		Crosby, Catherine

		Cc

		Rick Treatch; Kha Xiong; Jessica Revis

		Recipients

		CCrosby@co.fresno.ca.us; RTreatch@fresnochaffeezoo.org; KXiong@fresnochaffeezoo.org; JRevis@fresnochaffeezoo.org




Hi Cathy

I have attached the proposal from Outback. The list mentioned on Mark Rossi invoice. Note that his invoice outlined prices of two added pieces to that list. I have also attached the pictures for the sculptures.

Thanks!
Mayra :)


-----Original Message-----
From: Crosby, Catherine [mailto:CCrosby@co.fresno.ca.us] 
Sent: Monday, February 05, 2018 10:25 AM
To: Mayra Boganwright <mboganwright@fresnochaffeezoo.org>
Subject: RE: 2018-01C Capital Claim

We're good on CLR.  You had already provided the contract.  I was mistaken thinking I had not received one of the invoices, but I found it.
Thanks,
Cathy
600-4305

-----Original Message-----
From: Mayra Boganwright [mailto:mboganwright@fresnochaffeezoo.org]
Sent: Monday, February 05, 2018 10:12 AM
To: Crosby, Catherine <CCrosby@co.fresno.ca.us>
Subject: RE: 2018-01C Capital Claim

On the CLR were you looking for the contract or the invoice.

-----Original Message-----
From: Crosby, Catherine [mailto:CCrosby@co.fresno.ca.us]
Sent: Sunday, February 04, 2018 10:30 AM
To: Mayra Boganwright <mboganwright@fresnochaffeezoo.org>
Subject: RE: 2018-01C Capital Claim

Hi Mara,
My mistake; I had overlooked or misplaced the CLR invoice page.
For Outback, I need some description of the work proposed and completed, and for Mark Rossi, a description or photos of the sculptures.
Thank you,

Cathy
600-4305

-----Original Message-----
From: Mayra Boganwright [mailto:mboganwright@fresnochaffeezoo.org]
Sent: Sunday, February 04, 2018 9:56 AM
To: Crosby, Catherine <CCrosby@co.fresno.ca.us>
Subject: RE: 2018-01C Capital Claim

Hi Cathy,

I'm confused on the CLR invoice. What is it that you need ? I see the invoice attached.

Mayra

-----Original Message-----
From: Rick Treatch
Sent: Friday, February 02, 2018 12:29 PM
To: Mayra Boganwright <mboganwright@fresnochaffeezoo.org>
Cc: Kha Xiong <KXiong@fresnochaffeezoo.org>
Subject: FW: 2018-01C Capital Claim

We missed a few things

Dr. Rick Treatch, Ed. D., CPA, CGMA
Chief Financial Officer
Fresno Chaffee Zoo



894 W. Belmont Ave.
Fresno, CA  93728
Direct Line  (559) 498-5916
Main Line    (559) 498-5910
Fax Line      (559) 485-5046
RTreatch@fresnochaffeezoo.org
www.fresnochaffeezoo.org

"Fresno Chaffee Zoo inspires wonder of our natural world, provides an engaging learning environment, and creates a passion for conservation"
This e-mail and any files or document(s) transmitted with it are the property of Fresno Chaffee Zoo, are confidential and privileged, and are intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom this e-mail is addressed.  If you are not one of the named recipient(s) or otherwise have reason to believe that you have received this message in error, please notify the sender at 559-498-5953 and delete this message immediately from your computer.  Any other use, retention, dissemination, forwarding, printing, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited.   Thank you for your cooperation.


-----Original Message-----
From: Crosby, Catherine [mailto:CCrosby@co.fresno.ca.us]
Sent: Friday, February 2, 2018 12:12 PM
To: Rick Treatch <RTreatch@fresnochaffeezoo.org>
Subject: FW: 2018-01C Capital Claim

Rick,
Please also provide:
The proposal mentioned by Outback Concrete (See page 29) The list from Mark Rossi mentioned on page 30 The CLR invoice for $11,960 (See Page 31) Thank you, Cathy
600-4305


-----Original Message-----
From: Rick Treatch [mailto:RTreatch@fresnochaffeezoo.org]
Sent: Wednesday, January 31, 2018 2:59 PM
To: Crosby, Catherine <CCrosby@co.fresno.ca.us>
Subject: 2018-01C Capital Claim

Cathy,

Attached is capital Claim 2018-01C.  You will notice that there are a few BSK invoices from last September and October, these were being held for approval while the services and charges were being validated.  There are also a couple of Paul Halajian invoices from the September/October time frame.  These invoices were received late from the vendor and took a bit of time to be approved on our end.  You will also find a schedule reconciling the project management services by project.

Dr. Rick Treatch, Ed. D., CPA, CGMA
Chief Financial Officer
Fresno Chaffee Zoo



894 W. Belmont Ave.
Fresno, CA  93728
Direct Line  (559) 498-5916
Main Line    (559) 498-5910
Fax Line      (559) 485-5046
RTreatch@fresnochaffeezoo.org
www.fresnochaffeezoo.org

"Fresno Chaffee Zoo inspires wonder of our natural world, provides an engaging learning environment, and creates a passion for conservation"
This e-mail and any files or document(s) transmitted with it are the property of Fresno Chaffee Zoo, are confidential and privileged, and are intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom this e-mail is addressed.  If you are not one of the named recipient(s) or otherwise have reason to believe that you have received this message in error, please notify the sender at 559-498-5953 and delete this message immediately from your computer.  Any other use, retention, dissemination, forwarding, printing, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited.   Thank you for your cooperation.
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m.rossi clay sketch dipper.jpg







m.rossi clay sketch dragon fly.jpg







m.rossi clay sketch red leg frog wraccoon tracks.jpg







m.rossi clay sketch tiger salamander.jpg







m.rossi wax and clay sketch pondturtle.jpg
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