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Purpose: To validate the claimed amount on the supporting documents (invoices, gl, income statement) provided by the Zoo.
Source: Cathy Crosby, Zoo Coordinator, via email.
Procedures: Scan through income statement, gl, and invoices to ensure that each subtotal and totals tie to one another and is equal to the requested reimbursement amounts.
Conclusion: Invoices, gl, and income statement ties to each other and is equal to the amount requested in this 2018-01 Operations Claim. Reimbursement has been approved for processing.



paiher
Text Box
3/

paiher
Line



2018-01 Page 3 of 65

paiher
Text Box
2/

paiher
Text Box
2/

paiher
Text Box
2/

paiher
Text Box
2/

paiher
Text Box
51083.38

paiher
Line

paiher
Text Box
347527.79

paiher
Line

paiher
Text Box
347517.79

paiher
Text Box
2/

paiher
Text Box
2/

paiher
Text Box
13/

paiher
Text Box
15/

paiher
Text Box
38/

paiher
Text Box
17/



2018-01 Page 4 of 65

paiher
Text Box
Ties to attached GL



2018-01 Page 5 of 65



2018-01 Page 6 of 65



2018-01 Page 7 of 65



2018-01 Page 8 of 65



2018-01 Page 9 of 65



2018-01 Page 10 of 65



2018-01 Page 11 of 65



2018-01 Page 12 of 65



2018-01 Page 13 of 65

paiher
Text Box
3/



2018-01 Page 14 of 65



2018-01 Page 15 of 65

paiher
Text Box
3/



2018-01 Page 16 of 65



2018-01 Page 17 of 65

paiher
Text Box
3/



2018-01 Page 18 of 65



2018-01 Page 19 of 65



2018-01 Page 20 of 65



2018-01 Page 21 of 65



2018-01 Page 22 of 65



2018-01 Page 23 of 65



2018-01 Page 24 of 65



2018-01 Page 25 of 65



2018-01 Page 26 of 65



2018-01 Page 27 of 65



2018-01 Page 28 of 65



2018-01 Page 29 of 65



2018-01 Page 30 of 65



2018-01 Page 31 of 65



2018-01 Page 32 of 65



2018-01 Page 33 of 65



2018-01 Page 34 of 65



2018-01 Page 35 of 65



2018-01 Page 36 of 65



2018-01 Page 37 of 65



2018-01 Page 38 of 65

paiher
Text Box
51083.38

paiher
Text Box
51083.38

paiher
Text Box
3/



2018-01 Page 39 of 65



2018-01 Page 40 of 65



2018-01 Page 41 of 65

paiher
Text Box
Ties to attached invoices

paiher
Text Box
Ties to attached statement



2018-01 Page 42 of 65



2018-01 Page 43 of 65



2018-01 Page 44 of 65

paiher
Sticky Note
The total gas charges for the zoo hospital invoice is 438.02 and the total gas charges for the zoo rain forest water heater invoice is 1555.17 per Cathy's explanation in email.
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The total for invoice 12/21/17-1/19/18 is 438.02 per Cathy's explanation in email.
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The total for invoice 12/21/17-1/19/18 is 1555.17 per Cathy's explanation in email.
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From: Crosby, Catherine
To: Her, Pai
Cc: Reyes, Becky; Reynoso, Jose; Marks, Megan
Subject: FW: January Operating Claim 2018-01- PG&E Invoices
Date: Friday, February 16, 2018 10:43:45 AM
Attachments: Cathy"s utilities notes pdf pg 2 & 44.pdf

Ops Claim 2018-01 2.13.18.pdf

Good morning Pai,
I have completed my review of this claim.  The PG&E invoices Mayra sent have been merged into this
copy.  I have also attached page 2 and 44 of my copy with notes on the adjustment.
Please contact me if you have questions.
Thank you,
Cathy
600-4305

-----Original Message-----
From: Crosby, Catherine
Sent: Thursday, February 15, 2018 4:00 PM
To: 'Mayra Boganwright' <mboganwright@fresnochaffeezoo.org>
Cc: Kha Xiong <KXiong@fresnochaffeezoo.org>; Chris Erickson <CErickson@fresnochaffeezoo.org>;
Marks, Megan <mmarks@co.fresno.ca.us>; Reynoso, Jose <jreynoso@co.fresno.ca.us>; Reyes, Becky
<BReyes@co.fresno.ca.us>; Her, Pai <paiher@co.fresno.ca.us>; Rick Treatch
<RTreatch@fresnochaffeezoo.org>
Subject: RE: January Operating Claim 2018-01- PG&E Invoices

Hi Mayra,
Thank you for the invoices. We'll make the adjustment.
Cathy
600-4305

-----Original Message-----
From: Mayra Boganwright [mailto:mboganwright@fresnochaffeezoo.org]
Sent: Thursday, February 15, 2018 3:08 PM
To: Crosby, Catherine <CCrosby@co.fresno.ca.us>
Cc: Kha Xiong <KXiong@fresnochaffeezoo.org>; Chris Erickson <CErickson@fresnochaffeezoo.org>;
Marks, Megan <mmarks@co.fresno.ca.us>; Reynoso, Jose <jreynoso@co.fresno.ca.us>; Reyes, Becky
<BReyes@co.fresno.ca.us>; Her, Pai <paiher@co.fresno.ca.us>; Rick Treatch
<RTreatch@fresnochaffeezoo.org>
Subject: RE: January Operating Claim 2018-01- PG&E Invoices

-----Original Message-----
From: Rick Treatch
Sent: Thursday, February 15, 2018 2:54 PM
To: Crosby, Catherine <CCrosby@co.fresno.ca.us>
Cc: Kha Xiong <KXiong@fresnochaffeezoo.org>; Mayra Boganwright
<mboganwright@fresnochaffeezoo.org>; Chris Erickson <CErickson@fresnochaffeezoo.org>; Marks,
Megan <mmarks@co.fresno.ca.us>; Reynoso, Jose <jreynoso@co.fresno.ca.us>; Reyes, Becky
<BReyes@co.fresno.ca.us>; Her, Pai <paiher@co.fresno.ca.us>
Subject: RE: January Operating Claim 2018-01

Thank Cathy, Mayra will get you the copies of the invoices.  If you can make the adjustment to our
submittal we will be good.

Dr. Rick Treatch, Ed. D., CPA, CGMA
Chief Financial Officer
Fresno Chaffee Zoo

-----Original Message-----

mailto:/O=COUNTY OF FRESNO/OU=SERVICES/CN=RECIPIENTS/CN=CAC0510
mailto:paiher@co.fresno.ca.us
mailto:BReyes@co.fresno.ca.us
mailto:jreynoso@co.fresno.ca.us
mailto:mmarks@co.fresno.ca.us
mailto:mboganwright@fresnochaffeezoo.org
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From: Crosby, Catherine [mailto:CCrosby@co.fresno.ca.us]
Sent: Thursday, February 15, 2018 2:33 PM
To: Rick Treatch <RTreatch@fresnochaffeezoo.org>
Cc: Kha Xiong <KXiong@fresnochaffeezoo.org>; Mayra Boganwright
<mboganwright@fresnochaffeezoo.org>; Chris Erickson <CErickson@fresnochaffeezoo.org>; Marks,
Megan <mmarks@co.fresno.ca.us>; Reynoso, Jose <jreynoso@co.fresno.ca.us>; Reyes, Becky
<BReyes@co.fresno.ca.us>; Her, Pai <paiher@co.fresno.ca.us>
Subject: RE: January Operating Claim 2018-01

Good afternoon,
I have reviewed the claim and did not find the utility invoices listed on pdf page 44.  One thing I recall
from past years was that the end-of-the-year utility invoice costs were split into old and new years due
to the billing cycle overlapping, and that the same invoices were sent for both December and January,
requesting only costs on the invoice for that one month.  (See attached 2017-01, pdf page 51 and 53.) 
Since you ran out of Measure Z utility budget funds in the middle of the year, you will not be able to
claim the December cost for the two dated 12/21/17-1/1/18, except for 1/1/18, if you would like to
send those invoices.

You can re-submit the claim without December's utilities costs, or we can make the adjustment, but
please send the invoices in any case.
Thank you,
Cathy
600-4305

-----Original Message-----
From: Rick Treatch [mailto:RTreatch@fresnochaffeezoo.org]
Sent: Tuesday, February 13, 2018 12:52 PM
To: Crosby, Catherine <CCrosby@co.fresno.ca.us>
Cc: Kha Xiong <KXiong@fresnochaffeezoo.org>; Mayra Boganwright
<mboganwright@fresnochaffeezoo.org>; Chris Erickson <CErickson@fresnochaffeezoo.org>
Subject: January Operating Claim 2018-01

Cathy,

Attached is our January 2018 Operating claim

Dr. Rick Treatch, Ed. D., CPA, CGMA
Chief Financial Officer
Fresno Chaffee Zoo

mailto:CCrosby@co.fresno.ca.us
mailto:RTreatch@fresnochaffeezoo.org



